



Hogan Lovells US LLP
 1735 Market Street Floor 23
 Philadelphia, PA 19103
 United States
 T +1 267 675 4600
 F +1 267 675 4601
 www.hoganlovells.com

Joint Commission on Public Ethics
 Attn: Sanford N. Berland
 540 Broadway
 Albany, NY 12207

Date February 18, 2022
 Invoice No 21200010034
 Our ref 773074.000001
 Partner Courtney Devon Taylor
 Email courtney.taylor@hoganlovells.com
 Fed ID 53-0084704

PO # [REDACTED]
 SFS S [REDACTED]

[REDACTED]

Summary	Amount
	USD
Professional Services	69,912.00
Less Fee Cap Overage (contract maximum)	(20,871.90)
Total Professional Services	49,040.10
Total Disbursements and Charges	958.90
Subtotal	49,999.00
Total Due	49,999.00

Payment Details

Electronic payments should be sent to
 [REDACTED]
 Account: Hogan Lovells US LLP – Operating Account
 [REDACTED]

In light of COVID-19, we are requesting that our clients pay their invoice via ACH/wire transfer, if they are not doing so already.

Check payments may be sent to:
 Hogan Lovells US LLP
 P.O. Box 75890
 Baltimore, MD 21275-5890

Payment requested within 30 days from invoice date

Hogan Lovells US LLP is a limited liability partnership registered in the District of Columbia. "Hogan Lovells" is an international legal practice that includes Hogan Lovells US LLP and Hogan Lovells International LLP, with offices in: Alicante Amsterdam Baltimore Beijing Birmingham Boston Brussels Colorado Springs Denver Dubai Dusseldorf Frankfurt Hamburg Hanoi Ho Chi Minh City Hong Kong Houston Johannesburg London Los Angeles Luxembourg Madrid Mexico City Miami Milan Minneapolis Monterrey Moscow Munich New York Northern Virginia Paris Perth Philadelphia Rome San Francisco São Paulo Shanghai Silicon Valley Singapore Sydney Tokyo Warsaw Washington, D.C. Associated Offices: Budapest Jakarta Riyadh Shanghai FTZ Ulaanbaatar Zagreb. Business Service Centers: Johannesburg Louisville. Legal Service Center: Berlin. For more information see www.hoganlovells.com

Date February 18, 2022
Invoice No 21200010034
Our Ref 773074.000001

Period September 17, 2021

Detail by jurisdiction	Professional Services	Disbursements & Charges	Total USD
Hogan Lovells US LLP	49,040.10	958.90	49,999.00
Total	49,040.10	958.90	49,999.00

Disbursements & charges	Charges USD
Epiq eDiscovery Services Summary	958.90
Total	958.90

New York State Joint Commission on Public Ethics (JCOPE)

Date February 18, 2022
Invoice No 21200010034
Our Ref 773074.000001

Professional Services

Date	Name	LLP	Hours	Description
06/23/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.50	Call [REDACTED]
06/25/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.70	Confer [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]
06/26/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.90	Call [REDACTED]
06/28/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.80	Call [REDACTED]
06/28/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	1.20	Confer [REDACTED]; review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] research
06/30/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.50	Call [REDACTED]
07/09/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	1.00	Meeting [REDACTED]
07/09/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	1.20	Prepare [REDACTED] [REDACTED] emails [REDACTED]
07/13/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	1.20	Review [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]
07/14/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.50	Attend/participate [REDACTED] [REDACTED]
07/14/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	1.30	Confer [REDACTED]; confer [REDACTED]; emails with [REDACTED]
07/15/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	1.00	Meeting [REDACTED]
07/15/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	2.40	Prepare [REDACTED] emails with [REDACTED]
07/16/21	Wilzette Louis	HLUS	0.50	[REDACTED]
07/19/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.20	Confer [REDACTED]
07/19/21	Ian Lewis-Slammon	HLUS	2.40	Research
07/20/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.50	Meeting [REDACTED]
07/20/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.80	Confer [REDACTED]; confer [REDACTED] confer [REDACTED] [REDACTED]
07/20/21	Ian Lewis-Slammon	HLUS	0.10	Meet [REDACTED]

New York State Joint Commission on Public Ethics (JCOPE)

Date February 18, 2022
Invoice No 21200010034
Our Ref 773074.000001

[REDACTED]

Date	Name	LLP	Hours	Description
07/20/21	Ian Lewis-Slammon	HLUS	2.20	Research [REDACTED]
07/21/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.40	Confer [REDACTED]; emails with [REDACTED]
07/21/21	Ian Lewis-Slammon	HLUS	0.10	Call [REDACTED]
07/21/21	Ian Lewis-Slammon	HLUS	2.00	Research
07/21/21	Ian Lewis-Slammon	HLUS	3.10	Draft and revise [REDACTED]
07/22/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.80	Review [REDACTED]
07/22/21	Ian Lewis-Slammon	HLUS	0.30	Draft [REDACTED]
07/23/21	Ian Lewis-Slammon	HLUS	0.10	Email [REDACTED]
07/23/21	Ian Lewis-Slammon	HLUS	4.90	Draft [REDACTED]
07/25/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	1.00	Review [REDACTED]
07/26/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.50	Call [REDACTED]
07/26/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.50	Call [REDACTED]
07/26/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	2.20	Review and edit [REDACTED]; confer [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]; confer [REDACTED]
07/28/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.50	Finalize [REDACTED]
07/28/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.50	Calls [REDACTED]
07/28/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.80	Review [REDACTED]; confer [REDACTED];
07/29/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.80	Emails [REDACTED]; email [REDACTED]
07/29/21	Ian Lewis-Slammon	HLUS	0.20	Respond [REDACTED]
07/30/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.50	Call [REDACTED]
07/30/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	2.00	Confer [REDACTED]; confer [REDACTED]; confer [REDACTED]; confer [REDACTED]

New York State Joint Commission on Public Ethics (JCOPE)

Date February 18, 2022
Invoice No 21200010034
Our Ref 773074.000001



Date	Name	LLP	Hours	Description
08/02/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.50	Prepare [REDACTED]
08/02/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.40	Call [REDACTED]
08/02/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	2.00	Confer [REDACTED]; confer [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]
08/03/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.40	Call [REDACTED]
08/03/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.40	Call [REDACTED]
08/03/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.70	Emails [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]; confer [REDACTED]
08/04/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	1.50	Meeting [REDACTED]
08/04/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.50	Call [REDACTED]
08/04/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	3.40	Prepare [REDACTED]; prepare [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]
08/05/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.50	Confer [REDACTED]
08/09/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	1.50	Review [REDACTED] draft [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]
08/10/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.60	Review [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]
08/10/21	Wilzette Louis	HLUS	0.30	Verify [REDACTED] prepare [REDACTED]
08/11/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.50	Call [REDACTED]
08/11/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.90	Attend [REDACTED]
08/11/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	2.90	Confer [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]
08/12/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.30	Emails [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]; review [REDACTED]
08/13/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.50	Attend/participate [REDACTED]
08/13/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.50	Review [REDACTED]; confer [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]

New York State Joint Commission on Public Ethics (JCOPE)

Date February 18, 2022
Invoice No 21200010034
Our Ref 773074.000001

[REDACTED]

Date	Name	LLP	Hours	Description
08/13/21	Ian Lewis-Slammon	HLUS	0.40	Research [REDACTED]
08/14/21	Ian Lewis-Slammon	HLUS	2.30	Research [REDACTED]
08/14/21	Ian Lewis-Slammon	HLUS	0.50	Draft [REDACTED]
08/15/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.30	Review [REDACTED] emails [REDACTED]
08/16/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.30	Emails [REDACTED]
08/16/21	Ian Lewis-Slammon	HLUS	0.60	Research [REDACTED]
08/16/21	Ian Lewis-Slammon	HLUS	0.10	Email [REDACTED]
08/16/21	Wilzette Louis	HLUS	0.20	[REDACTED]
08/17/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	3.20	Review [REDACTED] emails [REDACTED]; [REDACTED] emails [REDACTED]
08/17/21	Wilzette Louis	HLUS	0.20	Generate [REDACTED]
08/18/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.70	Review [REDACTED] emails [REDACTED]
08/19/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.50	[REDACTED] emails [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]
08/20/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.50	Review [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]
08/20/21	Wilzette Louis	HLUS	0.30	[REDACTED]
08/20/21	Wilzette Louis	HLUS	0.20	Email [REDACTED] prepare [REDACTED]
08/23/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.20	Call [REDACTED]
08/23/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.50	Confer [REDACTED]
08/23/21	Wilzette Louis	HLUS	0.30	Verify [REDACTED] generate [REDACTED]
08/24/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.50	Review [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]
08/24/21	Wilzette Louis	HLUS	1.70	Prepare [REDACTED]

New York State Joint Commission on Public Ethics (JCOPE)

Date February 18, 2022
Invoice No 21200010034
Our Ref 773074.000001



Date	Name	LLP	Hours	Description
08/25/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.60	Emails [REDACTED]; review [REDACTED]
08/25/21	Wilzette Louis	HLUS	0.10	Share [REDACTED]
08/26/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.50	Emails [REDACTED]
08/27/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.50	Emails [REDACTED]; confer [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]
08/27/21	Wilzette Louis	HLUS	0.30	Email [REDACTED]
08/31/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.30	Emails [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]
09/02/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.50	Call [REDACTED]
09/02/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	1.30	Emails [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]
09/02/21	Wilzette Louis	HLUS	0.40	Communicate [REDACTED]
09/03/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	1.00	Emails [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]; teleconference [REDACTED]
09/03/21	Wilzette Louis	HLUS	1.50	[REDACTED]
09/07/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.20	Emails [REDACTED]
09/07/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.50	Review [REDACTED] emails [REDACTED]
09/08/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.50	Emails [REDACTED]; teleconference [REDACTED]
09/09/21	Wilzette Louis	HLUS	1.30	Identify [REDACTED] communicate [REDACTED]
09/10/21	Jonathan G Coppola	HLUS	1.30	Draft [REDACTED]; correspond [REDACTED]
09/10/21	Rebecca Shames	HLUS	2.50	Finalizing [REDACTED]
09/10/21	Wilzette Louis	HLUS	2.50	Communicate [REDACTED]
Total Hours			88.70	

New York State Joint Commission on Public Ethics (JCOPE)

Date

February 18, 2022

Invoice No

21200010034

Our Ref

773074.000001

Summary

Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate	Fees
Jim McGovern	40.30	860.00	34,658.00
Courtney Devon Taylor	15.50	860.00	13,330.00
Jonathan G Coppola	1.30	860.00	1,118.00
Ian Lewis-Slammon	19.30	860.00	16,598.00
Rebecca Shames	2.50	272.00	680.00
Wilzette Louis	9.80	360.00	3,528.00
Total Professional Services	88.70		USD 69,912.00
Less Fee Cap Overage (contract maximum)			(20,871.90)
Total Professional Services Charged			USD 49,040.10

New York State Joint Commission on Public Ethics (JCOPE)

Date	February 18, 2022
Invoice No	21200010034
Our Ref	773074.000001

Disbursement and Charges

Deduplication, Date Restriction, Key Term Filters and Native File Processing to Relativity Database - Per GB	0.45
Oversight and Guidance of Project Requests - Case Specific - Per Hour	562.50
Relativity Review Database Data Storage - Monthly - Per GB	14.70
Relativity User Licenses - Monthly Per Use	100.00
Execution of Specific Project Requests - Case Specific - Per Hour	281.25

Total for Other Charges

USD 958.90