



Hogan Lovells US LLP
 1735 Market Street Floor 23
 Philadelphia, PA 19103
 United States
 T +1 267 675 4600
 F +1 267 675 4601
 www.hoganlovells.com

Joint Commission on Public Ethics
 Attn: Sanford N. Berland
 540 Broadway
 Albany, NY 12207

Date: March 14, 2022
 Invoice No: 21200011454
 Our ref: 773074.000001
 Partner: Courtney Devon Taylor
 Email: courtney.taylor@hoganlovells.com
 Fed ID: 53-0084704

PO # [REDACTED]
 SFS [REDACTED]

[REDACTED]

Summary	Amount USD
Professional Services	51,080.00
Total Disbursements and Charges	843.63
Subtotal	51,923.63
Total Due	51,923.63

Payment Details

Electronic payments should be sent to
 [REDACTED]
 Account: Hogan Lovells US LLP – Operating Account
 [REDACTED]

PLEASE NOTE THAT EFFECTIVE
 OCTOBER 12 OUR P.O. BOX
 ADDRESS HAS CHANGED.

Check payments may be sent to:
 Hogan Lovells US LLP
 P.O. Box 715890
 Philadelphia, PA 19171-5890

Payment requested within
 30 days from invoice date

Date March 14, 2022
Invoice No 21200011454
Our Ref 773074.000001

Period February 28, 2022

Detail by jurisdiction	Professional Services	Disbursements & Charges	Total USD
Hogan Lovells US LLP	51,080.00	843.63	51,923.63
Total	51,080.00	843.63	51,923.63

Disbursements & charges	Charges USD
Taxi	28.90
Travel	429.26
Epiq eDiscovery Services Summary	385.47
Total	843.63

Joint Commission on Public Ethics

Date March 14, 2022
Invoice No 21200011454
Our Ref 773074.000001

Professional Services

Date	Name	LLP	Hours	Description
09/09/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	1.20	Conference [redacted]; emails [redacted]; emails with [redacted]; review [redacted]; emails [redacted]
09/10/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	3.20	Review [redacted] conferences [redacted]; conference [redacted]; emails [redacted]; conference [redacted]
09/13/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.30	Emails [redacted]
09/15/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.50	Emails [redacted] interviews [redacted]; emails [redacted]
09/16/21	Wilzette Louis	HLUS	0.30	Investigate [redacted] create [redacted]
09/17/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.90	Confer [redacted] emails [redacted] emails [redacted]; emails [redacted]
09/20/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.30	Emails [redacted]; emails [redacted]
09/21/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.80	Emails [redacted] emails [redacted]; confer [redacted]; emails [redacted]
09/23/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	1.50	Confer(s) [redacted] emails [redacted] emails [redacted]
09/23/21	Wilzette Louis	HLUS	0.60	Investigate [redacted]
09/24/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.50	Finalize [redacted]; emails [redacted]
09/24/21	Jonathan G Coppola	HLUS	0.50	Facilitate [redacted]; correspond [redacted]
09/27/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	1.00	Confer(s) [redacted]; emails [redacted]; confers [redacted]; emails [redacted]
09/29/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.20	Emails [redacted]
09/30/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	2.80	Prepare [redacted] attend [redacted]; confers [redacted]
10/01/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.70	[redacted] teleconference [redacted]
10/01/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	2.00	Confer [redacted]; Confer(s) [redacted]; emails [redacted]
10/01/21	Wilzette Louis	HLUS	0.50	Verify [redacted]; communicate [redacted]
10/01/21	Wilzette Louis	HLUS	0.20	Update [redacted]

Joint Commission on Public Ethics

Date March 14, 2022
Invoice No 21200011454
Our Ref 773074.000001



Date	Name	LLP	Hours	Description
10/02/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.50	emails
10/04/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.50	Confer
10/05/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	1.20	Confer ; emails; confer
10/06/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.10	Calls
10/07/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.70	Confer ; confer ; emails ; confer
10/15/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.20	Emails ; emails
10/18/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.20	Email
10/19/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	1.00	Confer
10/20/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.40	Confer ; emails
10/21/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	3.00	Prepare
10/21/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	4.00	Prepare meet emails ; confer
10/22/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.50	Attend/participate
10/22/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	1.00	Prepare for and represent emails
10/29/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.50	Conference
11/01/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.20	Review
11/02/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.50	Conference
11/03/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.40	Emails ; confer
11/04/21	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.50	Teleconference
11/04/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.90	Prepare for and attend ; confer
11/09/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.20	Emails
11/16/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.60	Emails emails ; conference
11/22/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.80	Confer emails confer

Joint Commission on Public Ethics

Date March 14, 2022
Invoice No 21200011454
Our Ref 773074.000001



Date	Name	LLP	Hours	Description
11/24/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.30	Emails [REDACTED]
11/30/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.20	Confer [REDACTED]
12/03/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.20	Confer [REDACTED]
12/10/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.40	Conference [REDACTED]
12/28/21	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.10	Listen [REDACTED] emails [REDACTED]
01/05/22	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.50	Call [REDACTED]
01/19/22	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.50	Call [REDACTED]
01/24/22	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.50	Confer [REDACTED]
02/01/22	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.50	Confer [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]
02/15/22	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.50	Confer [REDACTED]
02/16/22	Jim McGovern	HLUS	1.20	Confer [REDACTED]; confer [REDACTED]
02/17/22	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.20	Emails [REDACTED]
02/18/22	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	0.50	Call [REDACTED]
02/18/22	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.70	Prepare for and confer [REDACTED]; review [REDACTED]; emails [REDACTED]
02/22/22	Jim McGovern	HLUS	0.50	Emails [REDACTED]; confer [REDACTED]
02/23/22	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	1.00	Attend [REDACTED]
02/23/22	Jim McGovern	HLUS	1.80	Confer [REDACTED]; prepare [REDACTED]
02/23/22	Jonathan G Coppola	HLUS	1.50	Participate [REDACTED]; edit [REDACTED]; review [REDACTED]
02/24/22	Courtney Devon Taylor	HLUS	1.00	Attend [REDACTED]
02/24/22	Jim McGovern	HLUS	3.30	Emails [REDACTED] confer [REDACTED] confer [REDACTED]; prepare [REDACTED]; review [REDACTED]; review [REDACTED]
02/24/22	Jonathan G Coppola	HLUS	1.80	Edit [REDACTED]; participate [REDACTED];

Joint Commission on Public Ethics

Date March 14, 2022
Invoice No 21200011454
Our Ref 773074.000001



Date	Name	LLP	Hours	Description
				review [REDACTED]
02/24/22	Jay Russell	HLUS	1.90	Review [REDACTED] attend [REDACTED]
02/25/22	Jonathan G Coppola	HLUS	0.60	Meet [REDACTED]; conduct [REDACTED]
02/25/22	Jay Russell	HLUS	1.20	Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED]
02/25/22	Wilzette Louis	HLUS	0.30	Export [REDACTED]
02/27/22	Jonathan G Coppola	HLUS	0.50	Conduct [REDACTED] review [REDACTED]
02/27/22	Jay Russell	HLUS	1.70	Review [REDACTED]
02/28/22	Jay Russell	HLUS	1.20	Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED], confer [REDACTED]
Total Hours			60.50	

Joint Commission on Public Ethics

Date March 14, 2022
Invoice No 21200011454
Our Ref 773074.000001

Summary

Timekeeper Name	Hours	Rate	Fees
Jim McGovern	39.50	860.00	33,970.00
Courtney Devon Taylor	8.20	860.00	7,052.00
Jonathan G Coppola	4.90	860.00	4,214.00
Jay Russell	6.00	860.00	5,160.00
Wilzette Louis	1.90	360.00	684.00
Total Professional Services	60.50		USD 51,080.00

Joint Commission on Public Ethics

Date	March 14, 2022
Invoice No	21200011454
Our Ref	773074.000001

Disbursement and Charges

Courtney Devon Taylor - Courtney Taylor - Hotel - Dinner, 10/20/21, Prepare for and attend prep meeting , Courtney Taylor	54.51
Courtney Devon Taylor - Courtney Taylor - Car Service, 10/20/21, Car ride from Penn Station to hotel re: prep meeting on 10/21	52.13
Courtney Devon Taylor - Courtney Taylor - Taxi, 10/21/21, Taxi to train station re: prep meeting	28.90
Courtney Devon Taylor - Courtney Taylor - Lodging, 10/21/21, Prepare for and attend prep meeting	322.62
Relativity Review Database Data Storage - Monthly - Per GB	85.47
Relativity User Licenses - Monthly Per Use	300.00

Total for Other Charges

USD 843.63

Joint Commission on Public Ethics

Date March 14, 2022
Invoice No 21200011454
Our Ref 773074.000001

Outstanding Invoices

Paid-in-full invoices and corresponding payments are not shown below.
This summary reflects payments received through March 14, 2022
This statement includes the current invoice.

Invoice No.	Date	Fees	Other Charges	Total	Payments	Date Last Payment	Balance USD
21200010034	02/18/22	49,040.10	958.90	49,999.00	0.00		49,999.00
21200011454	03/14/22	51,080.00	843.63	51,923.63	0.00		51,923.63
Outstanding Invoices:							101,922.63